


A long time ago, in the time of Hogwarts. There was a magical cat named 
Nia, who never fit in. She was lonely. After time she found another magical 
cat who had magical hands. So she went over and said, “Hi I’m Nia, who are 
you? Do you wanna be friends?” The other cat answered “ My name is Clara. 
I’d love to be friends!”



Then the two best friends went to the big hall feast. At the feast they saw 
cats from the Slytheren house and they saw the kid that was in charge so 
they ignored him. They had a great time at the feast!



After the feast, they went to their class but before they could open the door 
they saw a cat who was all alone and lost. They walked over and said “Hi! 
Would you like to be friends?” She responded saying, “Yes! My name is 
parsley.” Their teachers told them “Hurry up kids! You’re going to be late!”



Suddenly, there were 9 goblins coming into the room. There were 1 big one 
and 8 tiny ones. Nia, Parsley and Clara saw the goblins coming in and got 
scared. So they got to action… flip the page to figure out how.



Thank you for flipping the page! So 8 goblins were down. But there was still 
the big one they had to fight, however Nia, Clara, and Parsley were out of 
supplies. So their teacher gave them three magic wands for Nia, Clara, and 
Parsley!



They were hero’s! Parsley, Clara and Nia they did something the kids at 
Hogwarts could never do! Everyone was impressed even the kid in slythrin 
and even the people in charge! 



There was one which had a magical and that was Nia. In case you forgot 
Clara had magical hands, thank you for remembering! And Parsley could 
sneeze out pixie dust. After the three became friends they stayed friends 
forever!😺😸😽🐱 Enemy! 🐶



Thank you for reading! We 
hope you enjoyed the book!




